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MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY

COMMISSIONER’S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022

Award bid(s) for the purchase of the following for county precincts:

a.
b.

o
d.
e.

Road paving;

AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2 emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven
equal;

Road materials;

Herbicides; and

Culverts.

Motion by Commissioner Gertson to approve awarding the bids for the purchase of the

following for county precincts Road Pavings; AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2

emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven equal; Road materials;

Herbicides; Based on price, availability, quality and location; seconded by Commissioner

Neuendorff; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered. Discussion followed.

Motion by Commissioner Neuendorff to deny the Culverts bid; Raymie Kana, County

Auditor advised that we can reject the bid and have a rebid; seconded by Commissioner

Kubesch; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered.

(See Attachment)
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MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY

COMMISSIONER’S COURT REGULAR MEETING

MARCH 14, 2022

BID TABULATION FOR

AC-5 ASPHALT, AC-10 ASPHALT, CRS-2 EMULSION, MC-30 ROAD OIL,

AND SEAL COAT SEALERS
OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 9, 2022 AT 2:00 P.M.
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2022 TO MARCH 31, 2023

Bidder: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Precincts
AC-5 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $3.30 $3.30 $3.30 $3.30
Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Colorado County Area $3.47 $3.47 $3.47 $3.47
*This bid is for full transport load of 5,500 gallons. Demurrage at $90 per hour, after second hour.
Bidder: Martin Asphalt Company Precincts
AC-5 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Plant $2.55 $2.55 $2.55 $2.55
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $2.70 $2.70 $2.70 $2.70
Bidder: Cleveland Asphalt Products Precincts
AC-5 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $3.70 $3.70 $3.70 $3.70
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $3.87 $3.87 $3.87 $3.87
Bidder: P Squared Emulsion Precincts
AC-S Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid Nobid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Valero Marketing & Supply Co Precincts
AC-5 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant - Houston or Corpus Christi Daily rack DR DR DR
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Precincts
AC-S Asphalt One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

with pump & hose

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area
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Bidder: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Precincts
AC-10 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 $3.25
Price per Gal. F.0.B. Colorado County Area $3.42 $3.42 $3.42 $3.42
*This bid is for full transport load of 5,500 gallons. Demurrage at $90 per hour, after second hour.
Bidder: Martin Asphalt Company Precincts
AC-10 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $2.55 $2.55 $2.55 $2.55
Price per Gal. F.O.B. 7~'~rado County Area $2.70 $2.70 $2.70 $2.70
Bidder: Cleveland Asphalt Products Precincts
AC-10 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $3.70 $3.70 $3.70 $3.70
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $3.87 $3.87 $3.87 $3.87
Bidder: P Squared Emulsion Precincts
AC-10 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant No bid Nobid | No bid No bid
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Valero Marketing and Supply Co Precincts
AC-10 Asphalt One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant - Houston or Corpus Christi Daily Rack DR DR DR
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Precincts
AC-10 Asphalt One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

with pump & hose

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area
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Bidder: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Precincts
CRS-2 Emulsion One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $2.45 $2.45 $2.45 $2.45
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $2.66 $2.66 $2.66 $2.66
*This bid is for full transport load of 5,500 gallons. Demurrage at $90 per hour, after second hour.
Bidder: Martin Asphalt Company Precincts
CRS-2 Emulsion One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $2.30 $2.30 $2.30 $2.30
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $2.45 $2.45 $2.45 $2.45
Bidder: Cleveland Asphalt Products Precincts
CRS-2 Emulsion One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $2.45 $2.45 $2.45 $2.45
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $2.62 $2.62 $2.62 $2.62
Bidder: P Squared Emulsion Precincts
CRS-2 Emulsion One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $2.74 $2.74 $2.74 $2.74
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $2.99 $2.99 $2.99 $2.99
Bidder: Valero Marketing & Supply Co Precincts
CRS-2 Emulsion One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Precincts
CRS-2 Emulsion One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

with pump & hose

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area
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Bidder: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Precincts
MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant No bid No bid No bid No bid
Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Martin Asphalt Company Precincts
MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $2.95 $2.95 $2.95 $2.95
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $3.10 $3.10 $3.10 $3.10
Bidder: Cleveland Asphalt Products Precincts
MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.Q.B. Plant $4.20 $4.20 $4.20 $4.20
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $4.37 $4.37 $4.37 $4.37
Bidder: P Squared Emulsion Precincts
MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $1.75 $1.75 $1.75 $1.75
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00
Bidder: Valero Marketing & Supply Co Precincts
MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant - Houston or Corpus Christi Daily Rack DR DR DR
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Precincts
MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

with pump & hose

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area
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Bidder: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Precincts
Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant No bid No bid No bid No bid
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid No bid No bid
Bidder: Martin Asphalt Company Precincts
Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant No bid No bid No bid No bid
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Cleveland Asphalt Products Precincts
Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $1.35 $1.35 $1.35 $1.35
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $1.52 $1.52 $1.52 $1.52
Bidder: P Squared Emulsion Precincts
Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant $2.57 $2.57 $2.57 $2.57
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area $2.82 $2.82 $2.82 $2.82
Bidder: Valero Marketing & Supply Co Precincts
Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
with pump & hose Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant No bid Nobid | No bid No bid
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area No bid No bid | No bid No bid
Bidder: Precincts
Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal One Two Three Four
Rock Island | Weimar | Frelsburg | Eagle Lake

with pump & hose

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area






